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Can the master of stealth master a maiden’s fragile heart?

Dragon Knights, Book 4

Nico is known as the Prince of Spies for a reason. He’s a cunning shapeshifter able to take the form of a
dragon at will—the gift of his royal heritage.

Riki lives in misery, chained up to serve a mad king’s perverted magic. Forced to use her draining healing
skills to keep him alive, Riki is a shadow of the woman she should be.

Nico knows Riki is the woman he’s been searching for the moment he sees her sad, beautiful face. He wastes
little time breaking them both out of the enemy palace, beginning an adventure that will take them across two
countries, through peril and danger, and the discovery of an undeniable love and mutual respect.

With the help of an old friend and ally, Nico teaches her the many varied and exciting ways of pleasure. Riki
teaches him a thing or two in return—including the fact that he should never underestimate her. Will Nico
have the courage to let her fly free, trusting she’ll return to him, or will his love smother the fledgling beauty
who is breathing free air for the first time in her tragic life?

This book is a re-issue – all the books in the series will be re-issued. 

Warning: Contains a princely scoundrel who enjoys a little exhibitionism when the mood strikes. He’s also
not above asking a friend to help pleasure his lady. Be careful, lest the dragon’s fire singe your senses.
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From reader reviews:

Olga Noone:

The actual book Prince of Spies (Dragon Knights Book 4) has a lot of information on it. So when you make
sure to read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was published by the very famous author.
Tom makes some research previous to write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you will get the
point easily after reading this article book.

Jeffrey Thibodeaux:

Why? Because this Prince of Spies (Dragon Knights Book 4) is an unordinary book that the inside of the
book waiting for you to snap it but latter it will shock you with the secret that inside. Reading this book close
to it was fantastic author who all write the book in such amazing way makes the content within easier to
understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good for you because of not
hesitating having this ever again or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you a lot of
benefits than the other book include such as help improving your proficiency and your critical thinking
approach. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I have been you I will go to the guide store
hurriedly.

Christopher Morton:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book specially book entitled
Prince of Spies (Dragon Knights Book 4) your mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in
every aspect that maybe unknown for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging every single word
written in a guide then become one application form conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never
get before. The Prince of Spies (Dragon Knights Book 4) giving you one more experience more than blown
away your brain but also giving you useful data for your better life on this era. So now let us show you the
relaxing pattern is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning
a game. Do you want to try this extraordinary spending spare time activity?

Louis McCarthy:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you, why because this Prince of Spies (Dragon Knights Book 4) e-
book written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book which might be understand by
anyone who all read the book. Written within good manner for you, leaking every ideas and writing skill
only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still question Prince of Spies (Dragon Knights Book 4)
as good book not simply by the cover but also by the content. This is one guide that can break don't
determine book by its cover, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on
your reading sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.
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